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Stephen LaMalfa of Scotia defeated Ricky Rovelli of Albany 213 – 180 to win 
the Capital District Youth Scholarship Tour tournament held at Uncle Sam 
Lanes on Saturday, November 20th.  LaMalfa was in sixth place following the 
qualifying round and fired a 263 in the first game of the semifinals to vault into 
second place. A victory in his third semifinal match enabled him to earn the 
top seed for the stepladder finals. 
 
Rovelli, who qualified third, was locked in on the championship pair. He began 
the finals with a 220 – 170 victory over Kalynn Carl of Albany and followed by 
tossing the first six strikes in a 231 – 160 win over Chris Hanson of Ballston 
Lake. Carl and Hanson earned $30 and $50 scholarships for finishing fourth 
and third, respectively.  In the title match, however, LaMalfa jumped out to an 
early lead.  Rovelli was able to stay close, but he opened in the 7th frame; 
LaMalfa followed with a key triple to pull away and win his first CDYST title and 
$150 scholarship prize. Rovelli earned a $90 scholarship for his runner-up 
finish.  
 
In an event marked by some of the highest scores of the season, Carl 
assumed the early lead with a 257 opening game and remained there until 
Shane Bartnicki of Niskayuna shot 249 in Game 4 to earn the top spot heading 
into the semifinals.  During the semifinals, the conclusion of each game saw a 
different leader; of note, Anthony Alix of Watervliet bowled the highest game of 
the season with a 278 in Game 5. 
 
In the third of eight monthly CDYST tournaments, there were 19 entries.  The 
next event will be held at Redwood Lanes on Saturday, December 11th at 
1:30 PM.  For more information about the CDYST, e-mail tournament directors 
Steve Fawcett and Mark Taylor at CDYSTinfo@aol.com or call 518-393-8296.  
The CDYST can also be found on Facebook. 
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Qualifying Round

Qualifying Total

Position Name City Game 1 Game 2 Game 3 Game 4 Total +/-

1 Shane Bartnicki Niskayuna 204 200 197 249 850 +50 Semifinalist

2 Kalynn Carl Albany 257 164 234 167 822 +22 Semifinalist

3 Chris Hanson Ballston Lake 165 190 203 240 798 -2 Semifinalist

4 Ricky Rovelli Albany 218 165 206 192 781 -19 Semifinalist

5 Justin Carl Albany 182 193 183 214 772 -28 Semifinalist

6 Stephen LaMalfa Scotia 183 173 201 205 762 -38 Semifinalist

7 Anthony Alix Watervliet 223 187 183 158 751 -49 Semifinalist

8 Rebecca Pratt Troy 180 176 175 214 745 -55 Semifinalist

9 Dillon Davis West Coxsackie 203 173 150 216 742 -58

10 Bethany Duchowny Charlton 173 171 193 205 742 -58

11 Brittany Hart Troy 202 139 203 180 724 -76

12 Tyler Smith Highland 189 175 179 171 714 -86

13 Scott Frament East Greenbush 180 191 151 185 707 -93

14 Chris Gongoleski Latham 181 185 156 180 702 -98

15 Matt Baker Watervliet 182 170 130 191 673 -127 Alternate*

16 Catie Bell Averill Park 158 151 145 195 649 -151

17 Casey Schoonmaker Albany 160 133 170 157 620 -180

18 Theresa Shufelt Watervliet 123 139 142 187 591 -209

19 Joe Wolf Schenectady 111 114 111 134 470 -330

Semifinal Round (All pins carryover from qualifying; 30-pin bonus for match win, 15-pin bonus for tie match)

Total Total Total

Position Name City Carryover Game 5 Bonus Game 6 Bonus Game 7 Bonus Pinfall Plus Bonus +/-

1 Stephen LaMalfa Scotia 762 263 30 172 0 207 30 1404 1464 +64 Finalist

2 Chris Hanson Ballston Lake 798 192 30 237 30 168 0 1395 1455 +55 Finalist

3 Ricky Rovelli Albany 781 170 0 217 30 212 30 1380 1440 +40 Finalist

4 Kalynn Carl Albany 822 181 30 179 30 178 0 1360 1420 +20 Finalist

5 Anthony Alix Watervliet 751 278 30 142 0 180 30 1351 1411 +11

6 Shane Bartnicki Niskayuna 850 157 0 188 30 178 0 1373 1403 +3

7 Rebecca Pratt Troy 745 193 0 167 0 199 30 1304 1334 -66

8 Matt Baker Watervliet 673 155* 0 189 0 1017 1017 -183

9 Justin Carl Albany 772 213 0 985 985 -15

* Justin Carl withdrew during Game 6 due to injury.  Matt Baker was highest-placed alternate available as a substitute.

Stepladder Finals

4 Kalynn Carl 170

3 Ricky Rovelli 231

3 Ricky Rovelli 220 3 Ricky Rovelli 180

2 Chris Hanson 160

1 Stephen LaMalfa 213

Scholarship

Position Name City Prize

1 Stephen LaMalfa Scotia $150

2 Ricky Rovelli Albany $90

3 Chris Hanson Ballston Lake $50

4 Kalynn Carl Albany $30

Stephen LaMalfa

Champion

 


